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Welcome Message 

We would like to extend a warm welcome to you and your family to our 
homestay program and thank you for your participation.  Homestay is an 
absolutely essential part of an international student’s study experience in 
Calgary. 

Our goal is to make the very best match possible to ensure an enriching 
experience for the student and for the host family.    

It is our sincere hope that you will develop lasting friendships with your 
guests and will gain a lifetime of memories. 

 

Global Learning Staff 
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Global Learning Contact Information 

 Address:  1221 – 8 Street SW 
    Calgary, AB  T2R 0L4 
  
 Phone Number: 403-817-7711 
 
 Email:   homestay@cbe.ab.ca 
  
 

Global Learning has a full team responsible for our homestay program. 
Host families are encouraged to contact our helpful staff with any 
questions or problems they may have pertaining to a student living in their 
home. Please contact our main office to be connected to the appropriate 
staff member. 

 

International Coordinator Contact Information 

Host families are encouraged to contact the International Student 
Coordinator at their student’s school with any schooling questions or 
problems.   
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Getting Ready 

Research 

Plan to do some research into the country your student is from.  Finding 
out as much as you can about such things as climate, lifestyle, food, and 
customs will make long-term understanding possible. 

You might even want to try to master a few simple words or phrases in 
their language or learn to cook a traditional meal! 

Room Preparation 

Make sure your student’s room is ready.  The room should be fully 
furnished with a bed, dresser, lamp, desk and closet.  There should also 
be some storage room available to the student either in the room or 
elsewhere. 

Your student may be cold at night so ensure there are plenty of extra 
blankets available and even a portable heater (especially if the room is in 
the basement).   

Key 

Prepare an extra house key for your student and ensure he/she has the 
alarm code (if applicable). 

Maps and Transportation 

Obtain a copy of the bus schedule for your area and local maps. 

Orientation Information 

Read Welcome Letter (issued separately) and familiarize yourself with 
assessment/orientation details at the school. 

Handbook 

Familiarize yourself with the Host Family Handbook. 
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Home Insurance  

Maintain an insurance policy which includes building and content 
insurance as well as liability coverage with respect to the student 
throughout the homestay period. 

Police Checks 

Ensure Criminal Security Check for all members in the household 18 
years of age and older has been completed and submitted to the Global 
Learning office. 

Wallet Card 

Prepare a wallet size contact list including home, work and cell phone 
numbers of all appropriate family members and also include the 
emergency services number for the student to carry. 

 

Arrival  

Airport Pick-up 

Arrange to pick your student up from the airport.  It is helpful to take a 
sign with you with your student’s name on it. 

 

Getting Settled 

House Tour 

When your student arrives, please give a comprehensive tour of your 
home.  Don’t assume he/she will know how to operate everyday items 
(anything from light switches to shower taps could be unfamiliar).  Be as 
clear as you can. 

Some specifics to let your student know: 

 There is no drain in the middle of the floor in your 
bathroom so if you have a shower curtain it needs to 
be placed inside the bathtub. 
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 Toilet paper can be flushed down the toilet but nothing 
else like sanitary napkins or paper towels. 

 
 Tap water is safe to drink. 

 
 Take shoes off when entering your home. 
 Are there appliances you prefer not to be handled 

(e.g., thermostat, BBQ)? 
 

 Demonstrate how to lock/unlock doors and use the 
security system if applicable. 

 
 Recycling practices vary around the world and this 

may be an unfamiliar practice to your student.  
  

 Leave the bathroom door open when not in use. 

Basements 

Basements may be strange and unfamiliar to your student and if the 
bedroom is in the basement, this may make your student uneasy.  Ensure 
to explain that this is typical of Canadian homes and can be seen as 
advantageous as it provides maximum privacy. 

Pets 

If you own animals, they may be frightening to your student. Be aware of 
this and help your student get used to your pets at a slow and 
comfortable pace. 

Community Tour 

Take your student on a tour of your community and local area showing 
points of interest such as shopping malls, banks, convenience stores, 
community centers, fitness facilities, etc. 

Transportation 

Your student is responsible for purchasing a monthly bus pass and will 
need you to explain where this can be purchased.  Also, ensure your 
student knows where the closest bus stop/train station is to your home 
and which bus to take to get to and from school or elsewhere, which 
stops to get off at, etc.   

An explanation of the bus system in Calgary will be necessary.  For 
example, buses run frequently during peak hours but can run infrequently 
otherwise.  Also, please explain the “honour” system on the train. 
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Household Guidelines 

It is important to discuss your household guidelines and why they are 
important to your family as soon as possible.  By having an honest and 
open dialogue at the beginning, you will avoid confusion and 
miscommunication later.  Students will appreciate knowing what is 
expected of them.   

You may want to write or type your guidelines out (i.e., some students 
have a stronger level of reading than oral comprehension) and leave a 
copy with the student. 

You will need to make the guidelines age-appropriate (e.g., curfew) and 
bear in mind that the student is coming from a very different household 
environment so adaptability will be important wherever necessary. 

You may also need to re-evaluate the guidelines over time to take into 
account the student’s maturity, your own family’s needs, etc. 

Some expectations that are typical in a home with international students 
are: 

 Keep your room clean and tidy 
 

 Clean up after using the bathroom 
 

 Clean up after using the kitchen 
 

 Notify of a change in plans (e.g., not coming home for dinner) 
 

 Ask permission to invite guests over 

Household Schedule 

Start thinking about your family’s schedule and routine and decide how 
the student might fit into it.  You will need to decide on areas where you 
can and cannot be flexible. 

Some things to think about are: 

 When do you eat meals? 
 

 What time do you shower or bathe?  Think about a schedule, time 
limit, etc. 

 

 What time do you get up and what time do you go to bed? 
 

 Is there a specific study time in your home? 
 

 Will your student be allowed to have food/drink in the bedroom?  
Around the computer?  In front of the television? 
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Laundry 

If you will be doing your student’s laundry, ensure they know where to put 
dirty clothes and when the laundry will be done. 

If your student will be responsible for doing their own laundry, be sure to 
explain how to work the machines, when laundry is done, and that the 
responsibility for folding and putting clothes away is theirs.   

Ensure your student knows what to do with your clothes if they are in the 
machines when he/she wants to do laundry. 

Telephone 

Help your student to purchase a long distance phone card and ask that it 
be used when making long distance phone calls. 

If you have one phone line that all family members share, ensure your 
student knows about time limits. 

Explain your phone’s features, (eg. call waiting). 

Computer 

If your student will be allowed to use your family computer, ensure you 
explain about time limits, downloading restrictions, etc. 

Please note:  

If your student brings a laptop and wants a dedicated internet connection 
installed, we strongly suggest you install this in a common area if possible 
instead of in the bedroom.  Students who have computers in their rooms 
will sometimes rely heavily on the ability to be connected to family and 
friends in their home country and do not assimilate with the host family or 
with life in Canada.   If the bedroom is the best place for the computer, 
you may want to monitor the computer usage and put time limits on it if 
warranted.    

All costs associated with internet installation will be the student’s. 

Privacy 

Ensure your student knows you will respect their privacy by knocking on 
the bedroom door before entering and ask the same in return.   

Ensure it is understood that you will not pry into personal belongings, 
phone conversations, mail, etc. 
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Religion 

Attending church may be an important part of your student’s life.  If you 
attend church, your student may want to attend with you or may choose 
to attend his/her own church.  Under no circumstances must he/she be 
required to attend your church or practice your religious beliefs.   If 
requested, please help your student to find a church in your 
neighbourhood. 

School 

High schools have various intake procedures.  Refer to the letter that was 
sent to you before the start of the semester for the intake procedures at 
your student’s school. 

Plan to accompany your student to their assessment appointment, school 
orientation/registration appointments as well as taking them to school on 
the first day. 

If the school is having an orientation and your student does not arrive in 
time to attend, please contact the co-ordinator at the school to make 
alternate arrangements. 

Assist with completing all required forms and make sure your student 
understands about extra fees due at the school (i.e., Phys. Ed costs, 
extracurricular expenses, textbooks, etc.).  We have had challenges with 
this in the past as students think they have paid the fees but school fees 
are over and above what they have paid to the Global Learning office and 
they are responsible for paying them directly to the school.   

Introduce yourself to the coordinator at the school so you can keep in 
close contact throughout the semester/school year. 

Bank Account 

Help your student set up a bank account with chequing privileges.  
Encourage your student to pay the homestay monthly fee with cheques 
and discourage them from carrying around large sums of cash. 

Money 

Students are required to have their own spending money to cover 
incidental expenses, like entertainment, personal items, school supplies 
and transportation fees.   

Host families may plan holidays or extracurricular activities and students 
are expected to share the costs of travel, fees, and other costs that may 
be incurred. If it is decided the student will not participate in the activity, 
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the homestay parents and the student must make alternate arrangements 
that are acceptable to all parties. 

However, if your family eats out on a regular basis, the student should not 
be expected to cover the costs for that. 

It is a good idea to discuss the extra costs with your student up front.  
When expectations are clear from the beginning, it is less awkward than 
waiting until there is a situation and dealing with it then. 

Homestay Payments 

Students will be placed based on the program dates indicated on the 
letter of acceptance.  If they arrive or depart outside of those dates, they 
will need to pay their homestay family at a nightly rate (see our website 
for program costs). 

 
Students are responsible for paying the monthly homestay fee in full 
(cash or cheque) directly to the family on the 1st day of each month for 
the duration of their program (unless otherwise arranged by the program). 

  
Please see our website for the monthly homestay fee which covers 
accommodation and food.  This amount is charged for the entire program, 
even during standard holidays or breaks where the student may not be 
present. This amount is not negotiable. The CBE reserves the right to 
change this fee without notice.  

 
If a student leaves homestay during July and August, homestay families 
may choose to store student belongings. (Visit our website for the fee 
associated with storage). 

 

Summer 

During the summer break, if you want to use the student’s 
accommodation (e.g. for guests, short-term summer students), ask your 
student to pack up the room neatly. 

Medical Insurance 

All international students are required to have health insurance for the 
duration of their studies and we have made these arrangements on their 
behalf.  Your student has been given a card to carry and all policy 
information, claim procedures and claim forms can be found on our web 
site at cbeinternational.ca/apply_health.htm.  Your student may need 
some help from you when submitting a claim. 
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Emergencies 

Ensure your student knows to dial 9-1-1 in case of an emergency. 

If there is an emergency involving your student, always call 9-1-1 first.  
Then, contact the homestay coordinator with the details of the 
emergency. 

Student Travel 

If students are planning to travel while studying with the Calgary Board of 
Education, they must have written permission from their natural parent(s) 
and from the homestay coordinator.  Any travel that a student undertakes 
should only occur during school vacation time. 

Visiting Parents 

If your student’s parents will be visiting, you are not expected to provide 
accommodation for them.  Feel free to request they make their own 
accomodation arrangements. 

Working While in Canada 

Students in Canada on a Study Permit (Visa) are not allowed to hold a 
paying job. 

Drinking and Drugs 

Both are strictly prohibited.  Please notify the homestay coordinator 
immediately if you are experiencing this with your student. 
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Challenges 

Jet Lag 

The ill effects of jet lag will be much easier if your student sets their watch 
immediately to local time right away.  Also, suggest they drink plenty of 
water, get lots of fresh air and avoid sleeping during the day if possible.  
Your student will benefit from getting into a sleeping pattern that matches 
local time as soon as possible. 

Culture Shock 

Upon arrival, your student may be jet-lagged, tired, emotional, homesick, 
and feeling very vulnerable and may immediately start to feel culture 
shock. 

I. What is Culture Shock? 

Culture shock is the feeling of not knowing what to do or how to do things 
in a new environment.  It is feeling lost and alone and not knowing what is 
appropriate or inappropriate. 

Culture shock is a very normal reaction to a new and different place.  It is 
expected when a person moves from a familiar environment to a new 
setting where language, food, clothing, manners and social relations are 
very different.  The person has been removed from familiar patterns of 
communication and the ways of normally expressing feelings.  Friends 
and family are being missed and routine activities are a struggle, such as 
grocery shopping or taking the bus. 

Culture shock will be intensified by the language difficulty.  If your student 
seems quiet or unresponsive, it may be that they are having trouble 
concentrating or are too tired to grasp an involved conversation and may 
need to “shut down” periodically.   

As well as being tired, there will be some frustration at not being able to 
communicate or make themselves understood.  Being forced to bring 
communication down to a very basic level can be difficult. 

You can assist your student by being patient, and speaking slowly and 
clearly.  Writing things down can be helpful as sometimes written 
comprehension is stronger than oral.  You will also need to be prepared 
to repeat things several times, even if your student says they understand 
what you have said.  In some cultures, it is considered impolite to admit 
you do not understand what a person is saying. 
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Help your student by giving time to adjust to the very new and different 
environment.  Eventually he/she will settle into a normal pattern but 
knowing there will be some ups and downs will help you and your family 
to understand and be supportive to your new family member. 

II. Stages of Culture Shock 

Your student will go through different stages as he/she settles into a new 
life in Canada.  Each stage can be ongoing or appear only at certain 
times.   

The first stage is the “honeymoon” stage, when everything is new and 
exciting. 

During the second stage, your student may have some difficult times and 
crises in daily life.   You may see difficulties in communicating, 
impatience, anger, sadness and feelings of inadequacy.  This happens 
while trying to adapt to a new culture that is very different from one’s own 
culture. 

During the third stage, your student will start to gain some understanding 
of the new culture and start to experience pleasure.  They will not feel lost 
anymore and will start to have a sense of direction.  They will be more 
familiar with their environment and want to belong. 

In the fourth stage, there is the realization that the new culture has good 
and bad things to offer.  A sense of belonging starts to develop and new 
goals for living in the new culture may be formed. 

The fifth stage is called “re-entry shock.”   This happens when your 
student returns to his/her home country.  People and customs seem to be 
different.  Your student will think a lot about the experiences in Canada 
and miss the friends that have been made.  Your student may even wish 
they did not return home. 

These stages happen at different times for everyone and each person 
reacts differently.  

Some stages will be longer and more difficult than others.  Many factors 
contribute to the effects of culture shock. 

You should also know that your own family will experience some culture 
shock as you get used to having a new member join your household.  
Some of the stages will be similar to those experienced by your student. 
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Canadian Customs 

Your customs may be very different and unfamiliar to your student and 
vice versa.  For instance, we tend to eat dinner quite a bit earlier than 
many countries.  When talking about differences, it is important to discuss 
them as cultural differences rather than right vs. wrong ways of doing 
things. 

Some of the differences you will see may be obvious like table manners 
and others may be subtler like opinions about the roles of women, 
parents or other ethnic cultures.  This may affect your student’s inclination 
to help out around the house or how he/she communicates with your 
family.  Conversations from the beginning about expectations will avoid 
unpleasantness later. 

Food 

One of the biggest areas of difficulty for international students is around 
food, which they tend to miss the most and may have trouble adjusting to 
our Canadian diet.  Please consider taking your student to one of the 
many ethnic grocery stores around the city a couple of times a month to 
stock up on “comfort” foods.     

Students sometimes bring or are sent “care packages” from home.  
Encourage your student to take advantage of this and use it as an 
opportunity to ask about their food. 

If you are hosting an Asian student, consider purchasing an inexpensive 
rice cooker. As rice is a staple in the Asian diet, this can be a very useful 
addition to your kitchen. 

It is not uncommon to have students contact us and tell us there is no 
food to eat in the home and they are hungry all the time.  When we follow 
up with the host family, they are very surprised by this and tell us there is 
a refrigerator full of food and that the student only needs to help 
himself/herself. 

Here is where the miscommunication tends to be: 

 the student may not know how to cook/prepare meals 
 

 the available food is unfamiliar 
 

 the concept of “helping yourself” may seem inappropriate or rude 
to the student  

 

It will be useful to spend the first couple of days helping your student to 
function in your kitchen until a level of comfort is reached. 
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Your student at school 

Your student will want opportunities to make Canadian friends.  Do you 
have a neighbour who goes to the same school that would ride the bus 
with your student?  Do you have friends with children the same age that 
would take your student skiing?  Any chance you have to help your 
student make connections with Canadian teenagers will be appreciated 
by your student and will make his/her experience a richer one. 

Encourage your student to join extracurricular activities at the school.  All 
schools have a variety of clubs and getting involved is extremely 
beneficial. 

Activities outside of school hours should also be encouraged. For 
example, if they play soccer in their home country, try to find a community 
soccer team they can join. 

Sometimes, despite your best intentions, your student will not take 
advantage of your suggestions.  Try not to be discouraged by this.  There 
may be a number of contributing factors and sometimes it’s merely the 
individual’s personality. 

Communication 

Establishing open and honest communication patterns from the start will 
be beneficial to everyone.  Host families are sometimes unsure of how to 
address issues or problems and this can lead to tension and conflict. 

Offering a warm, safe and secure environment where everyone feels 
comfortable to ask questions or talk about issues and problems will 
ensure that you foster a healthy relationship that can be relatively free of 
problems. 

Try to address issues as they come up.  Difficulties arise when a problem 
is left to grow.  The person being targeted is understandably surprised 
when the inevitable explosion occurs. 

Your student is still a teenager and will need regular reminders of your 
expectations, just like your own children do!  You will need to 
continuously think about your own actions, reactions and explanations.   

Canadian communication styles can be very different from other cultures.  
During business communication, for example, we like to get to the heart 
of the matter, discuss it, solve it and then move on.  Personal 
conversations sometimes involve expressing feelings.  These methods of 
problem solving may be startling for your student especially if they come 
from a culture where expressing personal feelings is discouraged or even 
unacceptable.  It is important to realize there are different communication 
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styles at work and to try to come up with an approach that works for all 
parties. 

Your student will need encouragement and patience and using reassuring 
phrases like “It must be difficult for you to talk about this” will go a long 
way to building a trusting relationship. 

If you are finding that, despite your best efforts, things are not going the 
way you want them too, feel free to contact one of our homestay 
coordinators who will be happy to come out and facilitate a discussion.  
Chances are, what you are encountering has been experienced by 
another host family and there may be a solution or compromise that 
works for everyone. 

 

Departure 

Arrange to take your student to the airport when they are returning home. 
If they would like to ship any items home, please assist them with this. 
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Host Family Guidelines  

Host families shall: 

 Take responsibility for making sure school fees are paid, 
applications for renewal are completed and submitted, bus pass is 
in place, bank accounts are set up (if applicable) and ensure the 
student knows how to get to and from school using public 
transportation. 
 

 Provide three nutritious meals per day, seven days a week (unless 
otherwise agreed to by program).  An evening meal shall be 
prepared and left if the family is not home for dinner or if the 
student comes home late from classes (unless otherwise agreed 
to by the program).   
 

 Ensure that the student does not have to prepare his/her own 
meals on a regular basis (unless otherwise agreed to by the 
program). 
 

 Interact with the student on a daily basis and include the student 
in appropriate family activities. 
 

 Provide each student with a private bedroom, which no other 
family member will visit for the duration of the program. 
 

 Ensure that the student does not visit any private area of the 
house, which includes the bedrooms of other family members, 
ensuite bathrooms, and any bathroom when another person is 
present. 
 

 Provide each student with a key to the house and the code for a 
residential alarm; if one is used. 
 

 Speak English when the student is present. 
 

 It is the responsibility of the homestay family to collect all rent and 
deposits directly from the student (unless otherwise agreed to by 
the program). 
 

 Maintain the homestay fee at the rate determined by Global 
Learning, Calgary Board of Education with no additional charges 
to the student. 
 

 Ensure that family members do not borrow money from the 
student and the student does not borrow money from family 
members. 
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 Maintain a homeowner’s insurance policy throughout the 
homestay period covering liability claims in respect of the student. 
 

 Contact Global Learning at the Calgary Board of Education if 
problems arise between student and other family members; 
cooperate with the Homestay Coordinator and Calgary Board of 
Education staff in trying to reach a reasonable, equitable solution 
for all concerned. 
 

 Inform Calgary Board of Education officials of all other students or 
houseguests living in the house, including those who take up 
residence after the student arrives; 
 

 Agree not to host more than two students at the same time. 
 

 Before accepting a student, inform Global Learning, Calgary 
Board of Education of plans to be away from the home for any 
period of time during the placement and ensure alternate 
arrangements are in place. 
 

 Ensure the student is not required to babysit. 
 

 Treat the student with respect and kindness and expect the same 
in return. 
 

 Never resort to abusive, aggressive or otherwise inappropriate 
behavior. 
 

 Never initiate or participate in a sexually-oriented discussion, the 
viewing of sexually explicit photographs, written materials or films 
with the student. 
 

 Always be suitably clothed and covered. 
 

 Never touch the student, other than to shake his/her hand in 
greeting or to say goodbye;  
 

 Take an active role in supporting the student. 
 

 Complete all forms for police check processing and submit along 
with required I.D. to Global Learning for all members of your 
household 18 years of age and older. 
 

 Provide a warm, secure, healthy, environment for international 
homestay students.   
 

 Respect the student’s privacy and expect the student to respect 
theirs. 
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Our students are particularly vulnerable because they are unfamiliar with 
Canadian customs and language and generally speaking, may not know 
to whom to turn for help.   
 
If a student reports that there are problems in the home such as alcohol 
or drug abuse, sexual impropriety, inappropriate conduct, or abusive 
language or behaviour, the student will be removed from the home 
without notice and legal or other action will be taken if warranted. 

 

The Calgary Board of Education reserves the right to move a student 
without the usual advance notice if a situation is unsatisfactory or if 
problems cannot be resolved between family members and the student.  
When a student is moved, the family may be required to return a portion 
of their homestay fee or may not receive a final fee payment. 
 
The homestay parents agree to assume all liability for loss or damage to 
their home caused by the student(s) and hereby release the Calgary 
Board of Education and its agents and employees from all liability arising 
out of the participation in the program, including, without limitation for 
property damage or loss, or the debts, conducts or actions of the students 
assigned to the home.  We understand that the students are responsible 
for their own debts, conduct, and actions while in the homestay program. 
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Student Guidelines  

CBE Homestay Program Policies and Procedures  

By accepting a placement with the CBE Homestay Program, you agree 
and understand the following:  

 

 Students will pay Calgary Board of Education an initial placement 
and supervision fee. This fee is non-refundable and does include 
airport pickup/drop-off.  
 

 Students will be placed based on the program dates indicated on 
the letter of acceptance.  If they arrive or depart outside of those 
dates, they will need to pay their homestay family at a nightly rate 
(see our website for current fees).  

 
 Students are responsible for paying the monthly homestay fee in 

full (cash or cheque) directly to the family on the 1st day of each 
month for the duration of their program (see our website for 
current fees). 
 

 Monthly fees are for accommodation and food.  This amount is 
charged for the entire program, even during standard holidays or 
breaks where the student may not be present. This amount is not 
negotiable. The CBE reserves the right to change this fee without 
notice.  
 

 If a student leaves their homestay during July and August, 
homestay families may choose to store student belongings (see 
our website for current fees). 
 

 Students must give the homestay family and Global Learning 
Homestay Coordinators one full month’s (30 days) notice if they 
wish to leave either the family or the program. If proper notice is 
not given, the student will not be reimbursed fees paid.   

 
 The Calgary Board of Education reserves the right to move a 

student without notice.  
 

 Students wishing to move their homestay must request to do so in 
writing. A move fee may be applied in addition to any outstanding 
fees. Moves will not occur the first month of arrival, unless 
deemed necessary by the Homestay Coordinators.  

 
 Students are responsible for reimbursing their host family for any 

damage or costs they may cause or incur. 
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 Students must take all of their belongings and leave their room 
clean when moving out.  

 
 Students cannot live on their own regardless of their age for the 

duration of their studies at the CBE, and must have a custodian 
who is over 25 and a Canadian Citizen.  

 
 Any change of address, living arrangement, etc., must 

immediately be reported to Global Learning and to your school. 
 

 If there is a change in custodianship, students must provide the 
school and Global Learning with notarized documents. 

 
 As the homestay placement is for Calgary Board of Education, 

any student who withdraws from the academic program must also 
withdraw from the CBE Homestay Program.  

 
 The Calgary Board of Education reserves the right to make 

exceptions or alterations to the above for short-term study 

programs.  
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5 

Behavioural Expectations 

The following behavioral expectations are for international students 
enrolled in the CBE Homestay Program.  The international student 
agrees to:  

 Respect that Canada is a diverse country and that customs and 
traditions of others may be different than his/her own.  
Discrimination based on colour, creed, race or religion will not be 
tolerated. 

 
 Make an effort to contribute and participate in family life and 

activities. The student must understand he/she is considered to be 
a contributing member of the family and not a “paying customer.” 
 

 Show consideration and respect to the family by following 
household rules, especially regarding curfews, meals, food, and 
tidiness. Good judgment and responsibility is expected. 
 

 Be clean and tidy in the home and voluntarily help with reasonable 
household chores (which may include common areas). 
 

 Gain permission from the host family prior to missing a meal, 
arriving home late, or sleeping at a friend’s house.  
 

 Invite guests to the home only with the knowledge and permission 
of the host family.  

 
 Consult the host family before using household appliances or 

equipment the first time and use them in ways approved by the 
family.  
 

 Use the telephone/internet/computer for reasonable lengths of 
times (i.e. 2-4 hours maximum). Respect house rules regarding 
computers.  
 

 Refrain from using the family phone for long distance calls without 
a phone card. 
 

 Not ask host family to co-sign for mobile phones. All contracts and 
expenses are the student’s responsibility. The CBE will not take 
responsibility for costs incurred.  
 

 Not borrow money from host family members.  
 

 Not enter host bedrooms, private rooms, or occupied bathrooms. 
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 Not resort to abusive, aggressive or inappropriate behavior 
(verbally or physically). Legal action may occur.   

 
 Never be sexually inappropriate (i.e. viewing sexually explicit 

photographs, written materials, films, or internet sites in the home 
or initiating or participating in sexually-oriented discussions with 
any member of the host family) 

 
 Always be suitably clothed and covered when in the presence of 

host family members.  
 

 Host families may plan holidays or extracurricular activities and 
students are expected to share the costs of travel, fees, and other 
costs that may be incurred.  

 
 Get written parental consent for Independent student travel 

outside the City of Calgary and provide details prior to travel. 
 

 Attend school on a regular, full-time basis – skipping classes is 
never permitted. 

 
 Not accept employment while attending a CBE educational 

program and in Canada on a study permit. 
 

 Not drive an automobile while in the Calgary Board of Education 
homestay program.   

 
 Not purchase or consume alcohol or illegal (non-medical) drugs 

regardless of his/her age. Students are not to be in bars, 
nightclubs, pubs or private parties where alcohol or drugs may be 
consumed.  

 
 Not use fraudulent identification for any reason.  

 
 Abide by all the rules of the Calgary Board of Education while 

attending school.  
 

 Abide by the laws of Canada and Alberta including the Criminal 
Code and Human Rights Code  

 

Conditions of Placement 

Calgary Board of Education reserves the right to ask a student to leave 
the homestay program at any time if the student’s behaviour in the home 
is unreasonable or unacceptable, or if the student fails to comply with the 
Regulations or Guidelines.  
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